


















































































































































W H AT ’ S  T H E  D I F F E R E N C E  B E T W E E N  I M P G S  A N D  P E R F O R M A N C E  S TA N D A R D S ?  
This Statement of Basis and the Draft Modification of the RCRA Permit include discussion of two related measures for the 
Rest of River remedy – the Interim Media Protection Goals (IMPGs), and the Performance Standards.  

In the investigation of Rest of River, EPA completed a Human Health Risk Assessment (HHRA) and an Ecological Risk 
Assessment. Taking into account the conclusions of the risk assessments, GE was required to propose IMPGs, which consist 
of preliminary goals that are shown to be protective of human health and the environment, and which served as points of 
departure in evaluating potential corrective measures in the Corrective Measures Study. Most of these IMPGs were identi-
fied as residual PCB concentrations in sediment, soil, or environmental media (like fish fillet tissue) across numerous risk-
based benchmarks, including cancer risk (at 10-6, 10-5, and 10-4 risk levels) across a number of exposure scenarios (residential, 
recreational, etc.), non-cancer risks, and ecological risks calculated at an “upper bound” (less stringent) and “lower bound” 
(more stringent) risk level. The discussion in the “Comparative Analysis of Combined Sediment/Floodplain Alternatives” in 
this document includes a discussion of how each alternative performs in attaining these various IMPGs. 

In the Draft Permit, EPA adopts certain of these IMPGs as Performance Standards. GE will be required to meet these and 
other Performance Standards as part of the remedy, as outlined in more detail in the Draft Permit. See Section II as well as 
Tables 1 through 4 of the Draft Permit for specific details. 

One example of the relationship of the IMPGs and the Performance Standards is the following.  In the HHRA, EPA evalu-
ated risks to humans from consuming PCB-contaminated fish tissue. GE used the information from the HHRA to develop 
the IMPGs for fish consumption, which are presented as a range of concentrations associated with different risk levels that 
correspond to different consumers and to different points on the EPA risk range. IMPGs were developed for both determin-
istic and probabilistic risk analyses. The range of concentrations for probabilistic IMPGs is shown on Figure 9. EPA selected 
one point in this range of concentrations to serve as the Performance Standard for fish consumption, the PCB concentration 
of 1.5 mg/kg in fish fillet tissue which is associated with the non-cancer probabilistic risk for the average adult fish consumer 
who is assumed to consume 14 fish meals per year, half of those from the Housatonic River. This Performance Standard is 
met when fish fillet concentrations are less than 1.5 mg/kg in all Reaches. Other fish tissue IMPGs were retained as bench-
marks in the Draft Permit, whereas other IMPGs for fish tissue were not carried over into the Permit. 
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